
JAMAICA 

No . ..5 -2015 

I assent, 

Governor-Genera/. 

~-tt;bg r 'lVI~, d..ol5 

AN ACT to Amend the Dangerous Drugs Act so as to provide 
for, among other things, the modification of p"enalties for the 
possession of ganja in specified small quantities and the 
smoking of ganja in specified circumstances, and for a 
scheme ofli.cences, permits and other authorizations for 
medical, therapeutic or scientific PYJPPses. 

The d~te notifi.ecJ br th~_~,u~tet: 
[ ttri'ng~ fAd into oyctratlon ] 

BE IT ENACTED by The ~ue~n's Most Excellent Majesty, by and 
with the advice and coment of the Senate and House ofRepresentatives 
of Jamaica, and by the authority of the same, as follows:-

1. This Act may be cited as the Dangerous Drugs (Amendment) Shon title 

Act, 2015, and shall be read and construed as one with the Dangerous and . 
construction 

Drugs Act (hereinaftt:r referred to as the principal Act) and all 
amendments thereto. 



2 

Commence· 
ment. 

Amendment 
of section 2 
of principal 
Act. 

Amendment 
of section 7 A 
of principal 
Act. 

[No. 1 The Dangerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 

2. This Act shall conie into operation Ctn such day or days as 
specified by the Minister by notice published in the Gazette, and different 
days may be specified in respect of different provisions of this Act. 

3. Section 2 of the principal. Act is amended-

( a) by deleting the definition of"ganja" and substituting therefor 
the following-

""ganja" includes all parts oftne plant cannabis sativa 
from which the resin hm. not been extracted and 
includes any resin obtained fn>m that plant, but 
does not include-

(i) medicinal preparations made from that 
plant; 

(it) hemp;"; 

(b) by inserting in the appropriate alphabetical sequence the 
following definitions-

""hemp" means the plant cannabis sativa, or any part 

thereof, with a THC concentration of no more 
than 1.0% or such other c;oncentration as may be 

prescribed by the Minister by order published in 
the Gazette; 

"THC" means 1::.. 9-Tetrahydrocannabino/ (6aR, 
1 OaR)-6a, 7, 8,1 Oa-tetrahydro-6, 6, 9-trimethyl-
3-pentyl-6H-dibenzo {b,d] pyran- 1 -
o1). (I'HC);". 

4. Section 7 A of the principal Act is amended-

( a) in subsection (1) by deleting the WCtrds "Every person" and 
substituting therefor the words "Subject to subsection ( 4), 
every person"; 

.,r 

.· 



The Da11gerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 [No. ] 

(b) by inserting next after subsection (3) the following 
subsectioxr-· 

" ( 4) Nothing in subsection (1) shall apply to any 
person who is certified by a registered medical 
practitioner to be-

(a} suffering from cancer or any other teiminal 
or serious chronic illness; and 

(b) a person the use by whom of any medicinal 
or therapeutic product comprising, derived 
from, or containing ganja, is recommended 
by that registered medical practitioner, 

as regards the importation of that medicinal or 
therapeutic product in an amount not exceeding that 
recommended by the registered medical practitioner 
and, in tne case of a medicinal or therapeutic product 
comprising ganja plant material, in accordance with 
regulations made under section 9A.". 

S. Section 7B of the :principal Act is amended by-

( a) deleting the words "Every person" and substituting therefor 
the words "Subject to subsections (2) and ( 4), every person"; 

(b) renumbering 1he section as section 7B(l) and inserting next 
thereafter the Jbllowing subsections-

" (2) Nothing in-. 

(a) subsection (l)(b), as relates to using or 
knowingly pennitting the use of any premises 
for the storage of ganja; or 

(b) subsection ( 1 )(c), as relates to using or 
,knowingly permitting the use of any 
conveyance for carrying ganja, 

shall apply in the circumstances referred to in subsection 
(3). 

3 

Amendment 
of section 78 
of principal 
Act. 



4 

Amendment 
of section 7C 
of principal 
Act .. 

[No. 1 The Dangerous Drugs (Amendmen() Act, 2015 

(3) For the purposes of subsection (2), the cir­
cwnstances are that-

( a) the total quantity of the ganja does not 
exceed the quantity specified in section 7F; 
or 

(b) the ganja is used or carried in connection 
with any of the purposes specified in section 
7C(2). 

( 4) Nothing in subsection (I) as it relates to the 
cultivation, gathering or storage of ganja shall be con­
strued to apply to five or less than five ganja plants 
found on any premises, and tllose plants so found shall 
be deemed to be grown for the medical or therapeutic 
use of the leaves or for horticultural purposes. 

(5) For the purposes of subsection ( 4) where 
there is more than one household on any premises, each 
household shall be treated as a separate premises.". 

6. Section 7C of the principal Act is amended by-

( a) deleting the words "Every person who has in his possession 
any ganja shall~ guilty of an offena:" and substituting therefor 
the words '"Subject to subsection (2), a person who is in 
possession of any ganja in excess of the quantity specified in 
section 7F commits an offence"; 

(b) deleting subsection (2) and insert:tng next after subsection 
( 1) the following subsection-

.. (2) Subsection (1) shall not apply to the 
possession of ganja for any of the following purposes-

(a) religious purpo:ies as a sacrament in 
adherence to the Rastafarian faith; 

(b) medical or therapeutic purposes as 
prescribed or recommended in writing by-

(i) a registered medical prac­
titioner; or 

(ii) other b~alth practitioner, or class 
of praetitioners, approved for 



The Dangerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 [No. ) 

that purpose by the Minister 
responsible for health by order 
published in the G~ette; 

(c) the purposes of scientific research-

(i) conducted by a duly accredited 
tertiary institution; or 

(ii) otherwise approved by the 
Scientific Research Council or 
such other body as may be 
prescribed by the Minister.". 

7. The principal Act i.s amended by deleting section 7D and inserting 
next after section 7C th~: following sections-

".Exceptions 7!>.--(1) Nothing in section 7 A, 78, 7C or 7F 
by licence, applies to the handling of ganja for medical, permit, etc. 

therapeutic or scientific purposes in accordance with 
a licence, permit or other authorisation issued under 
this Act or any other Act. 

(2) In subsection ( 1) and section 9A-

"handling" includes use, cultivation, processing, 
importation, exportation, transit, 
manufacture, sale, possession and 
distribution; 

"medical, therapeutic or scientific purposes" 
includes research, clinical trials, therapy 
and treatment, and the manufacture of 
nutraceuticals and pharmaceuticals. 

(3) In furtherance of scientific research 
undertaken by an institution or other body referred 
to in subsection (4), the Minister responsible for 
science and technology may by order published in 
the Gazette authorize that institution or other body 
(as the case may be) to-

(a) cultivate ganjaonlands designated by the 
Minister in the order; and 

Repeal and 
replacement 
of section 
70 and 
insertion of 
new sections 
7E to 7H 
into 
principal 
Act. 

5 



6 [No. ] 

(b) import into Jamaica any ganja plant or 
part thereof(fore)j:ample, seeds, saplings, 
and plant tissue) from any jurisdiction 
where the exportation of such plant or 
part thereof to Jamaica is lawful under 
the laws ofthatjuri.sdiction, in accordance 
with regulations made under section 9A. 

( 4) For the purpo:;es of subsection (3 ), 
the institutions or other bodi1~s are-

(a) a duly accredited tertiary institution or 
other body approved by the Scientific 
Research Council; or 

(b) any third party engaged for the purposes 
of subsection (3) by a tertiary institution 
or other body referred to in paragraph 
(a). 

( 5) The other sections of this Part shall not 
apply to any ganja which is the subject of an order 
under subsection (3) and which is handled in 
accordance with the order. 

( 6) The Minister responsible for justice may 
by order published in the Gazette authorize any-

( a) person who has attained the age of 
eighteen years and who the Minister is 
satisfied is an adherent of the Rastafarian 
faith or any group of such persons; or 

(b) organization that the Minister is satisfied 
is comprised of such persons, 

to cultivate, on lands designated by the Minister in 
the order and in accordance with such regulations 
as the Minister may prescribe for that purpose, ganja 
for use for religious purposes as a sacrament in 
adherence to the Rastafarian faith. 



The Da'fgerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 [No. ] 

(7) The other sections of this Part, with 
the exception of-

( a) section 7 A; 

(b) section 78 as it relates to selling or 
otherwise dealing in ganja; and 

(c) section 7E, 

shall not apply to ganja which is the subject of an 
order under subsection ( 6). 

(8) The Minister responsible for justice may 
by order published in the Gazette declare an event 
to \x: an exempt event for the purposes of subsection 
(9), if the Minister is satisfied that the event is-

(a) promoted or sponsored by-

(i) a person who is an adherent of 
the Rastafarian faith or any group 
of such persons; or 

(ii) any organization that is 
comprised of such persons, 
whether alone or in association 
with other persons who are not 
such adherents; and 

(b) primarily for the purpose of the 
celebration or observance of the 
Rastafarian faith. 

(9) Where an event is declared under 
sub:;;ection (8) to be exempt for the purposes of this 
sub:rection, no person shall be liable, under this Part, 
to arrest, detention, prosecution for any offence, or 
any other penalty, as regards ganja being conveyed 
to, or which is possessed or smoked at, the event in 
such amount and under such conditions as are 
spedfied in the order. 

7 



8 [No. 1 The Dangerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 

(10) The purchase and possession in 
J ~aica, by any person not ordinarily resident in 
Jamaica, of two ounces or .less of ganja at a time 
shall not be construed as an offence under this Part 
if the person-

(a) produces a voluntary declaration signed 
by that person, or any other satisfactory 
evidence, that the:: person's use of ganja 
is for medical or therapeutic purposes as 
prescribed or recommended in writing by 
a medical practitioner entitled to practice 
in the jurisdiction where the person is 
ordinarily resident; and 

(b) is in possession o:f a valid permit issued 
to that person under subsection (11). 

(11) A permit for the purposes of 
subsection (1 0) may be is~;ued by the Minister 
responsible for health upon application made in such 
form, and accompanied by such fee, as may be 
prescribed by that Minister by order published in 
the Gazette. 

(12) The Minister responsible for finance 
shall direct that such percentage, as may be 
prescribed by order published in the Gazette, of 
the fees received for the issue of any licence, permit 
or other authorization under :this section or section 
9 A be applied for the following purposes--

(a) strengthening the capacity and 
programmes of the: National Council on 
Drug Abuse, including public education 
programmes to discourage the use of .... 
ganja by persons under the age of eighteen 
years, persons with a mental disorder, 
pregnant women and other vulnerable 
groups; 



I 
'-
/ 

The Dangerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 [No. ] 

(b) strengthening Jamaica's mental health 
institutions and services; · 

(c) funding scientific and medical research 
into ganja or hemp; and 

(d) supporting the regulatory arrangements 
arising under regulations made pursuant 
to section 9 A. 

7E. The provisions of the First Schedule shall apply to the smoking 
of ganja in public places as described in the First Schedule. 

9 

Smoking of 
ganja in 
public places 
prohibited. 
First 
Schedule. 

7F.--( 1) Subject to subsection (2), a person who is in possession 1•ossession or 

of ganja of a quantity which in total does not exceed the prescribed ~~!~ in 

amount contravenes tl:~s subsection. quantity. 

(2) Subsection ( 1) shall not apply to the possession of ganja 
for a purpose specified in section 7C(2). 

(3) In this section, "the prescribed amount" means two ounces 
or such other amount as may be specified by the Minister by order 
subject to affirmative 11~lution. 

7G--(1) Notwith:;tanding sections 23 and 24, a person who 
contravenes section 7F( 1) or a provision of the First Schedule shall not 
.be liable to be arrested or detained therefor, but shall be liable to a 
fixed penalty of five hundred dollars. 

(2) A constable who has reasonable grounds to believe that a 
person is in contrav~ntion of section 7F( 1) or a provision of the First 
Schedule shall, by giving the prescribed notice in writing in accordance 
with subsection (3), offer that person the opportunity to discharge the 
fixed penalty. 

(3) A notice in accordance with this subsection shall-

( a) give such particulars of the contravention alleged as is 
necessary for giving reasonable information of the allegation; 

Penalty for 
contravention 
in relation to 
smoking or 
possession in 
small 
quantities. 

First 
Schedule. 



10 [No. 1 The Dangerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 

(b) state that the fixed penalty shall be paid within thirty days 
after the date of the notice; 

(c) state the amount of the fixed penalty and that such fixed 
penalty shall be paid to any Collector ofT axes; 

(d) require the person, in the event that the fixed penalty is not 
paid within the period specified in the notice, to attend before 
the Petty Sessions Court in the parish in which the 
contravention is alleged to have been committed, to answer 
to a charge under subsection (8) on such date as may be 
specified, being a date not earlier than ten days after the 
expiration of the period specified pursuant to subsection (6); 

(e) in any case falling within subsection ( 4 ), refer the person to 
the National Council for Drug Abuse or such other body as 
the Minister may presct?be. 

( 4) For the purposes of subsection (3 )(e), a case falls within 
this subsection if the person to whom the notice is to be issued-

( a) is under the age of eighteen years; or 

(b) is eighteen years or older and app<:::ars, to the constable 
issuing the notice, to be dependent on ganja. 

(5) A person to whom a notice is issued tmderthis section shall 
not be liable to be convicted of an offence under subsection (8) if the 
fixed penalty is paid in accordance with this section before the final 
adjudication of the case. 

( 6) Where a person is issued a notice under this section, pro­
ceedings shall not be taken against the person for an offence under 
subsection (8) until the expiration ofthirty days after the date of the 
notice or such longer period (if any) as may be specified in the notice. 

(7) In any proceedings a certificate that payment of the fixed 
penalty was or was not made to the Collector of Taxes by a date speci­
fied in the certificate shall, if the certificate purports to be signed by the 
Collector ofT axes, be sufficient evidence of the facts stated unless the 
contrary is proved. 



I 

I 

The D'rngerous Drugs (Amendment) .Act, 20/ j [No. ] .11 

(8) A person who, without reasonable cause or excuse, fails 
to pay the fixed penalty in accordance with a notice issued to that per­
son under this section commits an offence and shall be liable upon con­
viction in a Petty Sessions Court-

( a) to perform unpaid work for such number ofhours ~gin 
the aggregat~ not less than forty nor more than three)lundred 
and sixty) as may be specified by the COurt in an order inade 
for that purpose; or 

(b) if the Court is not satisfied that arrangements can be made in 
the area in which the offender resides, or will reside, for the 
offender to perform work under an order made under 
paragraph (a) and for !he proper supervision of that work, 
to a fme of two thousand dollars. 

(9) The prov1.sions of sections 10(3) to (6) and 11 of the 
Criminal Justice (Reform) Act shall apply to an order made under 
subsection (8X a) as if that order were a coii)Illunity service order made 
under section 10 of that Act. 

( 1 0) For the ptll'pOSes of the Criminal Records (Rehabilitation 
of Offenders) Act, a contravention of section 7F or a provision of the 
First Schedule shall not form a part of the criminal record of the offender. First 

Schedule. 
( 11) A notice 1mder subsection (3) shall, for the purposes of 

paragraph (d) of that subsection, be deemed to be a summons under 
section 2 of the Justices of the Peace Jurisdiction Act. 

7H.-( 1) The Minhter may make regulations- Regulations. 

(a) prescribing the procedure and criteria for registration of places 
ofRastafarian worship for the purposes of the definition of 
"public plac:e" set out in the First Schedule; 

(b) prescribing the form of notice to be issued under section 
7G;and 

(c) subject to affinnative resolution, amending-­

(i) the First Schedule; or 



12 

Insertion of 
new section 
9A into 
principal 
Act. 

[No. ] The Dangerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 

(n) section 70(3) or (8)(b) so as to vary the amount 
of the penalzy which may ·be imposed under that 
provision. 

(2) In this section, "Minister" means, 1or the purposes of.­

( a) subsection (1 )(a), the Minister responsible for justice; 

(b) subsection (1 X c Xi), the Minister responsible for health; and 

(c) subsection ( 1 )(b) and ( c )(ii), the Minister responsible for 
national security.". 

8. The principal Act is amended by inserting next after section 9 the 
following section-

··Control of 
handling of 
hemp and 
ganja. 

9A.-(l) For the purpose of enabling the 
establishment of a lawful, regLilated industry in-

(a) hemp; and 

(b) ganja for medical, tnerapeutic or scientific 
purposes, 

there is hereby established a Cannabis Licensing 
Authority (in this Act referred to as ''the Authority"). 

(2) The Authority shall have-

(a) the power to make, with the approval of 
the Minister responsible for justice, 
regulations for the issue and regulation, 
by the Authority, of such licences, pennits 
and authorizat:lons, as may be 
appropriate, for the:: handling of.-

(i) hemp; and 

(ii) ganja for medical, therapeutic or 
scientific purposes within the 
meaning of section 7D; 



t 
J 

I 

f 

' I 
t 

J 

I 

.. 

The Dangerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 [No. ] 

(b) the duty to ensure that regulations made 
under paragraph (a) do not contravene 
Jamaica's international obligations; and 

(c) such other powers, functions and duties 
as may be assigned to the Authority under 
this Act or any other law. 

(3) TheprovisionsoftheSecondSchedule second 
shall have effect with respect to the constitution of Schedule. 
the Authority and otherwise in relation thereto. 

( 4) Without prejudice to the generality of 
paragraph (a) of subsection (2), regulations made 
under that paragraph may provide for-

( a) the procedure governing applications for 
the licences, permits and other authoriza­
tions referred to in that paragraph, 
including the infonnation to be submitted 
with such applications; 

(b) the criteria for the grant of those licences, 
permits and other authorizations; 

(c) the inclusion of such tenns and conditions 
in those licences, permits and other 
authorizations, as the Authority considers 
appropriate; 

(d) the procedures to be complied with by 
holders of those licences, permits and 
other authorizations to secure compliance 
with this Act and the regulations, and the 
monitoring of such compliance (for 
example, requirements for reporting and 
inspections); 

(e) the circumstances in which those licences, 
permits and other authorizations may be 
suspended or revoked; and 

13 



14 [No. ] 

Sc:cond 
Schc:dulc:. 

The Dangerous Drug:r (Amendmc!l.ll) Act. 2015 

(t) the tees payable for the application, gmnt 
or renewal of tho&:: licences. pennits and 
other authorizations. 

(5) Unless otherwise provided in 
regulations made pursuant to this section, the 
provisions ofPart V-

(a) shall not apply to hemp or gartia handled 
in accordance with a licence, permit or 
other authorization issued pursuant to 
regulations made under this section; 

(b) except as provided in paragraph (a). shall 
apply to-

(i) all parts, and any extract or 
tincture, of the plant cannabis 
sativa; and 

(ii) all preparations of which resins 
obtainc::d from the plant 
cannabis sativa form the. 
base, 

as if such part, extract, tincture or 
preparation, as the case may be, were 
a '"dangerous drug" within the meaning 
ofsection 12. 

( 6) The Ministers ref erred to in paragraph 
1 of the Second Schedule shall ensure that their 
respective ministries provide the Authority with such 
support services as the Authority may reasonably · 
require to effectively carry out its functions and 
duties. 

(7) An appeal shall be to an appeal tribunal 
constituted in accordance with regulations made 
under section 29, in respect of any decision of the 
Authority to refuse, suspend or revoke a licence, 
pennit or other authorization re£!rred to in subsection 
(2)(a).". 



J 

J 
I 

·~ I 
f ... .. 

I 
'I 

I 
\ 

: 

./ 
'.! 

·. 

The Dangerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 [No. ] 

9. Section 10 of the principal Act is amended in subsection (I) by 
deleting paragraph (b). 

15 

Amendment 
of section I 0 
of principal 
Act. 

10. Section 12 ofthe principal Act is amended in the definition of Amendment 
"dangerous drug" by deleting the words ", coca leaves, and all of section 12 

of principal 
preparations of which resins obtained from the plant cannabis sativa Act. 
form the base" and substituting therefor the words "and coca leaves". 

11. Section 19 oftht: principal Act is amended by inserting next 
after the words "other than" the words "Part IliA, section 9A and". 

12. The principal Act is amended by inserting next after section 28 
the following sections and schedules-

" Regulations. 

Power to 
amend 
Second 
·schedule and 
penalties. 

29.-( 1) The Minister may, subject to sections 
4, 7Df6), 7H, 9 and 9A, make regulations in order 
to giv1! effect to the purposes of this Act. 

(2) Regulations made Under this Act may 
provide for penalties for offences under those 
regulations, in excess of the amount specified by 
section 29 of the Interpretation Act but not, in any 
event, exceeding one million dollars or six months 
imprisonment. 

30. The Minister may, by order subject to 
affirmative resolution, amend-

( a) the Second Schedule; 

(b) the monetary penalties imposed by this 
Act. 

Amendment 
of section I \1 
of principal 
Act. 
Insertion of 
new sections 
2\1 and 30 
and First and 
Second 
Schedules 
into 
principal 
Act. 



16 [No. 1 The Dangerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 

FIRST SCHEDULE (Sections 7E, 70 and 7H) 

.Provisions Regarding Smok1ng 
in Public Places 

l. In this Schedule-

''public conveyance" means any form or mo<l.e of transportation which 
carries passengers, for hire or reward, whether in Jamaica or 
internationally, but does not include priv:ltely operated vehicles not 
used for commercial purposes; 

''public place"-

(a) means any-

(Q structure; 

(it) facility; 

(fu) space used for gathering by individuals; 

(iv) other place, 

for the use of, or open to, the public, or any other similar 
space accessible to the public; 

(b) includes-

(Q bars, restaurants and clubs; 

(it} tourist establishments, except for such open 
areas formi11g part of a tourist 
establishment, as may be specifically 
identified by the management of the 
establishment ~.s areas where smoking is 
permitted; 

(fu) Government otl:ices; and 

(iv) other places or buildings of all types, 
accessible to the public; 

(c) does not include-

(Q privately-occupied residences not used for 
commercial pu1poses; 

(ii) any place registered pursuant to 
regulations made under section 7H to be a 
place of Rastaf:rrian worship; 

-~ 
; 



.; 

The Dangerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 [No. ] 

(iii) any place licensed under regulations made 

under section 9A as a place where the 

smoking of ganja is permissible for medical 

or therapeutic purposes in accordance with 

section 7C(2Xb) or 70( I 0); 

"tourist establishment" has the meaning assigned to it by the Public 
Health (Tourist Establishment) Regulations, 2000; 

"workplace" means any area or place used by persons during their 
employment, work or contract for services, and includes-

(a) vehicles used in the course of employment or for 

work purposes; 

(b) connected, annexed places or common areas; and 

(c) residences used for commercially-operated 

childcare activities. 

? A person who smokt:s ganja in or within a five metre radius of the entrance, 

exit, window or ventilation intake of a public place, workplace or public 

conveyance, including but not limited to any place listed in paragraph 3, 

contravenes this Schedult:. 

3. For the purposes of paragraph 2, the places listed are­

(a) all Governmen1 occupied offices; 

(b) health facilities, including pharmacies; 

(c) sports, athletic and other similar facilities, for the use of the public; 

(d) educational in!;titutions; 

(e) bus stops and c.eparture and arrival waiting areas at a port or station 

for any form of transportation; 

(t) areas specifica ly for use by children; 

(g) balconies of tcurist establishments; 

(h) residences and guesthouses for the use of staff employed therein; 

(i) beaches; 

17 



18 [No. 1 The Dangerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 

(jj outdoor dining and service areas; · 

(k) parks; 

(I) any sites declared under the Jamaica National Heritage Trust Act to 
be ''national heritage"; 

(m) class A and class B swimming pools operat,~d under the Public Health ·~; 

(Swimming Pools) Regulations, 2000, or under the Public Health 
(Tourist Establishments) Regulations, 2000 (except pools for private 
use or where a pool is exclusively accessible for an independent or ... 
private villa or suite); 

(n) outdoor markets; and 

(o) other outdoor events or activities, being used for gathering by 
individuals. 



\ 

.; 

I 
.. I 

j 
' 

.J 
I " 

! 

The! Dwlgc!I'OIIS Drugs (A mendmt•nl) .·It-t. 1015 !No. 

SECOND Sl'IIEI>lii.E 

(Sections 9A(3)) 

Cannubi.•· Licc?nsing Autlwri~1· 

I. The Authority shall consist of the ti.lllowing Appuinlm.:nl 
members- uf m.:mll.·rs . 

(a) one member appointed by th~ Minist~r 
responsible tor agriculture; 

(b) one member appoint~d by th~ Minist~r 
responsible tor health; 

(c) 1wo members appointed by the Minister 
responsible for industry and commerc~; 

(d) ~Jne member appointed by the Minister 
1·esponsible tor justice; 

(e) one member appointed by the Minister 
:esponsible for national security; 

(t) :me member appointeJ by the Minister 
responsible for science and technology; 

(g) one member appointed by the Minister 
responsible for tinance; 

(h) on~ member appointed by the Minister 
responsible for foreign affairs; 

(i) ex oj)icio. tlw cllainnan of the National Council on 
Drug Abuse; and 

(j) the followin~. members. appointed by the Minister 
responsible t'br justice-

(i) a rertesentative of the Attorney-General's 
Department. with expertise in the area of 
inte111ationallaw; 

(ii) a person representative of academia; and 

(iii) tilUrpersons representatiw of civil society 
groups, and other non-governmental 
community-based and faith-based 
organizations. 

2. The Minister shall s~lect one of the members of the Authority Chairman. 

to be the chairman of the A~.thority. 

• 1 =• oz n1c tYIMISter. 

· (4) The provisions ofp·tra h 
a member of a committee wh .'. grap s 13 and 14 shall apply to 
like manner as they apply to o ~~. nobt a member of the Authority in 

a mem er of the Authority. 

19 



/ 

20 [No. ] The Dang~·rous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 

Lea\·e and 3.-{ I) The Minister may, on the application of any member of 
temporary the Authority, grant to such member leave of absence for any 
appoint- period not ex,;eeding six months. ments. 

(2) In the case of the absence or inability to act of any 
member of the: Authority, theM inister may, after consultation with 

,.~: 

the Minister responsible for appointing the member concerned (in 
the case of an appointment made by a Minister other than the 
Minister resp)nsible for industry and commerce), appoint any 
person to act temporarily in the place of such member. 

·~ 

(3) In ,Jle case of the chairman's absence or inability to act 
at any meeting, the remaining members of the Authority shall elect 
one of their number to preside at that meeting. 

Tenure of 4.-( I) The: appointment of each member of the Authority shall 
office. be evidenced by an instrument in writing, and such instrument 

shall state the period of office of the member, which period shall 
not exceed thre:e years. 

(2) EV•!ry member of the Authority shall be eligible for 
reappointment. 

(3) Notwithstanding anything to the contrary, the Minister 
who appointed a particular member of the Authority may, at any 
time, revoke thf appointment of that member. 

Resignation. 5.-(1) Any member of the Authority other than the chairman 
may, at any time, resign as member by instrument in writing 
addressed to the: Minister and transmitted through the chairman, 
and from the date of receipt by the Minister of such instrument 
such member sh:lll cease to be a member of the Authority. 

(2) The ·:hairman may, at any time, resign his oflice by 
instrument in writing addressed to the Minister, and such 
resignation shall take effect as from the date ofthe receipt of such 
instrument by th1~ Minister. 

Publication 6. The names of all members ofthe Authority as first constituted 
of member- . and every change: in the membership thereof shall be published in 
ship. the Gazelle. 

Authoriza- 7. All documents and all decisions of the Authority may be 
tion of signified under the hand of the chairman or any member or officer documents 
and decisions. of the Authority authorized to act in that behalf. 

Procedure 8.-(1) The Authority shall meet at such times as may be 
and meetings. necessary or expc:dient for the transaction of business, and such 



) 

I 

j 

The pangerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 

meetings shall be held at su:h times and on such days as the 

Authority shall determine. 

{2) The chairman or, in the case of the inability to act of the 
chairman, the member acting as chairman, shall preside at all 
meetings of the Authority, and. when so presiding the chairman or 
the member acting as chairman, as the case may be, shall have an 
original and a casting vote. 

(3) The quorum ofth1~ Authority shall be six members of 
the Authority including the c:hairman or the member acting as 
chairman. 

(4) Subjectto the provisions of this Schedule, the Authority 
may regulate its own proceedings. 

( 5) The clr.lirman may, at any time, call a special meeting of 
the AuthoJiity and shall call ~, special meeting to be held within 
seven days I from the receipt of the written request for that purpose 
addressed to him by at least t.vo members of the Authority. 

( 6) The validit-y-of any -proceedings of the Authority shall 
not be affected by any vacan1~y amongst the members thereof or 
by any defect in the appointment of a member thereof. 

9. There shall be paid to the chairman and other members of the 
Authority and to th' membem of any committee appointed under 
paragraph 1 0 such remuneration, if any (whether by way of salaries 
or travelling o,r other allowan1~es ), as the Minister may determine. 

10.-(1) The Authority may appoint such committees, for any 
general or special purposes with which the Authority may be 
concerned, as in the opinion of the Authority would be better 
regulated and managed by mc:ans of a committee. 

(2) The number of members of a committee appofu~d under 
sub-paragraph ( 1 ), their functions and terms of appointkent, the 
quorum of the committee and the area, if any, within;\vhich the 
committee is to exercise authority shall be determ~ed by the 
Authority with the approval of the Minister. 

(3) A committee appc inted pursuant to this paragraph may 
include persons who are not members of the Authority, so, however, 
that the appointment of any such person shall be subject to the 
approval of the Minister. 

(4) The provisions ofparagraphs 13 and 14 shall apply to 
a member of a committee who is not a member of the Authority in 
like manner as they apply to :1. member of the Authority. 

[No. ] 

Renumeration 
of members. 

Appointment 
of commit­
tees. 

21 



22 [No. 1 The Dangerous Drugs (Amendmen~ 1 Act, 2015 .. 
(5) The validity of the proceedi11gs of a committee appointed 

pursuant to this paragraph shall not 1:: e affected by any vacancy 
amongst the members thereof or by any defect in the appointment 
of a member thereof. 

Power to 11.-{ I) Subject to sub-paragraph (2), it shall be lawful for the ·' appoint Authority to appoint and employ at such remuneration and on 
,. 

officers, 
such terms and conditions as it thi11 ks fit, such officers, other other 

employees employees, and agents, as the Authol'ity considers necessary for >;-. 
and agents. the proper carrying out of its functions. 

(2) No appointment to a post 4;arrying a salary in excess of 
the rate of one million five hundred thousand dollars per annum 
shan be made without the prior approval of the Minister responsible 
for the public service. 

(3) The Governor-General m:ly, subject to such conditions 
as he may impose, approve the appointment of any public officer 
in the service of Jamaica to any office with the Authority and any 
public officer so appointed shall, in relation to pension, gratuity 
allowance and to other r.ights as a public officer, be treated as 
continuing in the service ofthe Government. 

Regulations 12. The Authority may, with the ~.pproval of the Minister, make 
gove~~ing . regulations determining generally the conditions of service of 
condltaons ot . . 
service and officers and other employees of the Authonty and relatmg to the 
pensions of grant of pensions, gratuities and other benefits to or in respect of 
employees. the service of such officers and other employees. 

Protection of 13.-{ I) No action, suit, prosecution or other proceedings shall 
members of be brought or instituted personally against any member of the Authority. 

Authority in respect of any act done bona fide in pursuance or 
execution or intended execution of this Act. 

(2) Where any member of the Authority is exempt from 
liability by reason only of the provisions of this paragraph the 
Authority shall be liable to the extent that it would be if the said 
member was an employee or agent of the Authority. 

Protection 14. No act done or proceedings taken under this Act shall be 
tbr acts and questioned on the ground of-
proceedings. 

(a) the existence of any v~,cancy in the membership of, or 
any defect in the comtitution of, the Authority; or .., 

(b) any omission, defect ')r irregularity not affecting the 
merits of the case. 



r 
t 
J 

i 
. t 
I , 
) 

,,., 

I 

, .. .. 

~-

The Da'lgerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 [No. ] 23 

15. The office of chairman or member of the Authority shall .not be a public Office of 
office for the purposes of Chapter V ofthe Constitution ofJamaica. chairman or 

member not a 
public otfice. 

16.-(1) The Authority :;hall- Accounts, 

(a) 
audit and 

keep proper act;ounts and other records in relation to the business estimates. 

(b) 

(c) 

of the Authori~f; 

prepare annually a statement of accounts in a form satisfactory to 
the Minister; ar,.d 

submit the statement of accounts to the Auditor-General or an auditor 
appointed by the: Authority with the approval of the Minister, to be 
audited. 

(2) The Authority shall, at least sixty days before the end of its financial 
year, submit to the Minister for approval, the Authority's estimates of revenue 
and expenditure in respect of the next ensuing financial year. 

17.-( 1) The Authority shall, within four months after the end of its fmancial Annual 
year, cause to be made and tnnsmitted to the Minister a report dealing generally report. 

with the activities of the AUihority during that financial year, and containing 
such information relating to tile proceedings and policy of the Authority as can 
be made public without detriment to the interest oftheAuthority. 

(2) The Minister shall cause a copy of the report together with the 
annual statement of accounts and the auditor's report thereon and on the 
accounts to be laid on the Table of each House of Parliament. 

18. The Minister may, after consultation with the chairman, give to the Policy 
Authority directions as to the: policy to be followed by the Authority in the direction. 

performance of its functions. 

19. In this Schedule, unless otherwise indicated, "Minister" means the Minister Interpreta-

responsible for industry and commerce. tion.". 



24 

Amendment 
of Schedule 
to principal 
Act and 
references 
thereto. 

Amendment 
of penalties. 
Schedule. 

Amendments 
to other 
enactments. 

[No. 1 The Dangerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 

13.-( 1) The Schedule to the princip~.l Act is amended by 
renumbering it as the Third Schedule. 

(2) The principal Act is amended by deleting all references to 
the "Schedule" wherever they appear and substituting therefor in each 
case the words '"Third Schedule". 

14. The penalties set out in the provisions of the principal Act 
specified in Column 1 of the Schedule to this Act. are amended in the 
manner indicated with respect theretoTn Column 2 of the Schedule to 
this Act. 

15.-( 1) The Constabulary Force Act is amended-

( a) in section 18 by deleting the words "'ganja (Cannabis 
Sativa),"; 

(b) in section 19 by deleting the word ""ganja.". 

(2) Section 40 of the Customs Act is amended in paragraph 
(xi) by inserting immediately after the words ·•the Dangerous Drugs 
Act" the words'', except in accordance with a licence, permit or other 
authorization (as the case may require) is:med under that Act or in 
accordance with section 7 A( 4) of that Act". 

(3) Section 7(3) of the Drug Court (Treatment and 
Rehabilitation of Offenders) Act is amended-

( a) by deleting paragraph (a) and substituting therefor the 
following-

.. (a) possession of-

(i) not more th~:1n one ounce of prepared 
opmm; 

(ii) more than two ounces but less than eight 
ounces of ganja; 

(iii) not more than one-tenth of an ounce of 
cocaine, heroin or morphine, as the case 
maybe;"; 

.. 



The Dangerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 [No. ] 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting the words "or ganja, as the case 
maybe"; 

(c) by deleting paragraph (c) and substituting therefor the 
following-

~~ (c) smoking or otherwise using­

(i) prepared opium; or 

(ii) ganja, in contravention of section 7E of 
that Act, where the person has 
contravened that section on two or more 
previous occasions.". 

(4) The Food and Drugs Regulations, 1975, are amended in 
the Fifth Schedule by inserting immediately after the word 
"Tetrahydrocannabinoe" the words 1', or Tetrahydrocannabinol". 

( 5) The Criminal Records (Rehabilitation of Offenders) Act is 
amended in section 28A( 1) by deleting paragraph (b). 

25 



26 [No. ] The Dangerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 
/' 

SCHEDULE (Section 14) 

Column 1 Column2 

Penalty Provision Amendment ) 
~ ,, 

I. Section 7A(IXa) I. Deletf· the words "five hundred 
~,. 

dollars" and substitute therefor the . 
words "one ·:housand and five hundred 
dollars". 

2 Section 7A(IXbXi) 2.-(l) Delete the words "three 
hundred dollars" and substitute 
therefor the words "nine hundred 
dollars". 

(2) Delete the words "five 
hundred dollars" and substitute 
therefor the words "one thousand and 
five hundred dollars". 

(3) Delete the words "five 
hundred thousand dollars" and 
substitute therefor the words ''three 
million dollars". 

3. Section 78( d) 3. Delete~ the words ''two hundred 
dollars" and substitute therefor the . 
words "fi·1e hundred dollars". 

4. Section 78(eXi) 4.-(1) Delete the words "one 
hundred d'lllars" and substitute 
therefor the words ''two hundred and 
fifty dollars". 

(2) Delete the words "two 
hundred d•>llars" and substitute 
therefor th•' words "five hundred 
dollars". 

(3) Delete the words "five 
hundred thousand dollars" and 
substitute therefor the words "one 
million dollars". 

~ 

< 



'._i 
The Dm•gerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 2015 [No. ] 27 

Column I Column2 

I Penalty Provision Amendment 

' 5. Section 7C(b )(i) 5. Delete the words "one hundred 
dollars" and substitute therefor the 

·- words "two hundred and fifty dollars". 

6. Section 8A(2)(b) 6. Delete the words "five hundred 
thousand dollars" and substitute 

I therefor the words "five million .I 

I dollars". 

7. Section 88(2Xb) 7. Delete the words "five hundred 
thousand dollars" llnd substitute 

i 'therefor the words "two million : 
dollars". 

8. Section 21 A( I X d) 8.-(1) Delete the ~o~d,s: ','(iffy 
thousand dollars'• and 'si:ib.st1fute. · 

therefor the words "two hundred , 
'\:' thousand dollars". 

(2) Delete the words "one 
hund~ed thouslu1d' dollar~'"'' and. 

substl!ut~ ·~llc::r~fQr. :th~ . wor~s. ''five 
hunqred thcm~!llld ;<to liars". 

; ,. -· ·.' .· . . .... 
9. Section 22{2Xb) 9. Delete the words "five hundred 

thousand dollars" and substitute 
therefor Ule .\Vo.r~s :~fiy~. ~iiJiol) 
dollars". 

10. Section 22{3Xb) 10. Delete the words "five hundred 
thousand dollars" and substitute 
therefor the words "two million 
dollars". 

II. Section 22{ 4Xb) II. Delete the words "five hundred 
thousand dollars" and substitute 
therefor the words "five million 
dollars". 



28 [No. ] The Dangerous Drugs (Amendment) Act, 1015 

Column I 

Penalty Provision 

12. Section 22(5) 

13. Section22(10)(b) 

Column:! 

Amendment 

12. Delete the words "fifteen 

thousand dollars" and substitute 
therefor the words ··thirty thousand 
dollars". 

13. D~lete the words ··five hundred 
dollars" md substitute therefor the 
words .. fiFty thousand dollars". 

Passed in the Senate this 6th day ofF ebruary, 2015 w [th tive ( 5) amendments. 

FLOYD E. MORRIS 

President. 

Passed in the House of Representatives this 24th day ofF ebruary 2015. 

This printed impression has been careji11/y 
compared by me with the authenticated 
impression of the foregoing Act, and has been 
found by me to be a true and correct printed copy 

ofthe.aid Act. k ('~ 'J4. /L -Clerk to i 1 Houses of Parliament. 

MICHAEL A. PEART 

Speaker. 


